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FACULTY 
 

 

Casey Flaherty is Chief Strategy Officer at LexFusion where he helps 
accelerate legal innovation. Casey is a LegalTech founder and has 
been a BigLaw litigator, in-house counsel, legal operations consult-
ant, and law firm executive. He is an expert in the shifting dynamics 
of the legal market, legal technology, and the design of legal services 
to meet business needs at scale and pace. 
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Katherine Lowry serves as the Chief Information Officer for 
BakerHostetler, Co-Chair of the Emerging Technology team of 
BakerHostetler's Digital Assets and Data Management Group and 
leads the firm's legal technology consulting and R&D team, 
IncuBaker™, which is known for helping lawyers navigate the 
intersection of digital business, emerging technology, and the law. 
She is an award-winning leader for delivering transformational 
technology initiatives such as augmentation of legal services using 
AI and forming one of the first captive ALSP’s to the legal industry, 
IncuBaker, and developing go-to market services to support 
integration of legal technology across multiple industries.  
 
Katherine is passionate about aligning business strategy and digital 
imperatives to deliver critical solutions to law firms and corporate 
legal departments, creating operational stability, reducing highly 
manual workflows, operationalizing risk management, gaining 
competitive advantages through transformation, and creating data 
enriched client experiences by embracing innovative strategies.  
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Lydia Petrakis 

Microsoft 
 

 
Lydia Petrakis is Senior Corporate Counsel and Digital Strategist in 
Microsoft’s Corporate, External, and Legal Affairs (CELA) department 
on the Modern CELA team that focuses on driving industry-leading 
innovation to create the future of Microsoft’s legal practice. Her key 
responsibilities are strategist, driver and change agent, and story-
teller and ambassador focusing on culture, processes, tools, and 
external engagement to advance the digital transformation journey. 
Prior to this role, Lydia served as a product attorney supporting 
Microsoft’s business and engineering teams responsible for Office 
365 products and services. Prior to joining Microsoft, Lydia was legal 
counsel for MicroStrategy. Lydia graduated Summa Cum Laude with 
a B.A. in Political Science from Clemson University. Lydia received 
her J.D. from the George Mason University School of Law. 

 

 
Darth Vaughn 

Ford Motor Company 
 

 
Darth Vaughn serves as Litigation Counsel and Legal Innovation 
Lead at Ford Motor Company. Darth is a driving force in the com-
pany's use of artificial intelligence to improve legal outcomes. With 
his extensive expertise in the application of AI to the practice of law, 
he has helped Ford's legal department become one of the pioneers 
in this field. Darth's background as a successful trial attorney and 
business technology consultant gives him the unique perspective 
and skills necessary to develop innovative solutions for the next 
generation of legal service delivery. 
 

 
Farrah Pepper 

Marsh McLennan 

 
MODERATOR 

 
Farrah Pepper is the Chief Legal Innovation Counsel (CLIC) at Marsh 
McLennan, where she makes things…click. Farrah created and leads 
the company’s Legal Innovation & Technology (LIT) team, including 
the LIT Lab (legal innovation lab) and the legal data discovery pro-
gram.  Farrah is a fellow and a member of the Board of Directors of 
the College of Law Practice Management. Farrah is Vice President 
and a member of the Board of Directors of CLOC (Corporate Legal 
Operations Consortium), a leading global organization dedicated to 
transforming the business and practice of law. She has recently been 
named as In-House Innovator of the Year (Legaltech’s Leaders in Tech 
Law), a Relativity AI Visionary and received a Relativity Innovation 
Award for Inclusion. She is a two-time ACC Value Champion and a 
2021 ILTA Influential Woman of Legal Tech. 

 


